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Ogra prepares summary seeking hike in fuel prices: sources 

 ISLAMABAD: Oil and Gas Regulatory Authority (Ogra) has prepared 
a summary, seeking an increase in petrol prices from June 01, ARY 
NEWS reported quoting sources. 

 https://arynews.tv/en/petrol-prices-ogra-pakistan/  

 
LPG price hike Rs20 per kilo, dealers dread further increase shortly 

 KARACHI: The Liquid Petroleum Gas (LPG) cylinder prices have 
Sunday gone up exorbitantly by Rs20 per kilo to now sell at Rs110 
confirmed LPG Dealers Association chairman, ARY News learned. 

 https://www.samaa.tv/news/2021/05/ogra-recommends-no-changes-
in-petrol-prices/  

 
OGRA recommends no changes in petrol prices 

 The Oil and Regulatory Authority has recommended the government 
not to increase petrol prices. 

 https://www.samaa.tv/news/2021/05/ogra-recommends-no-changes-
in-petrol-prices/  

 
OGRA proposes hiking petroleum prices from June 1 

 The Oil and Gas Regulatory Authority (OGRA) has suggested the  
Petroleum Division increase the prices of petroleum products from 
June 1. 

 https://www.thenews.com.pk/latest/842202-ogra-proposes-hiking-
petroleum-prices-from-june-1  

 
Transportation: Ogra to bring LPG bowsers into regulatory regime 

 ISLAMABAD: The Oil and Gas Regulatory Authority (Ogra) moved 
forward to bring LPG bowsers for transportation of LPG into the 
regulatory regime, and issued adequate number of licenses to 
carry/transport LPG. The list of licensed LPG bowsers along-with 
licensing mechanism/criteria has been placed at the Ogra's website. 

 https://www.brecorder.com/news/40096117/transportation-ogra-to-
bring-lpg-bowsers-into-regulatory-regime  

 
OGRA moves to bring LPG bowsers into regulatory regime 

 ISLAMABAD: The Oil and Gas Regulatory Authority (OGRA) has 
moved forward to bring LPG bowsers for transportation of Liquefied 
Petroleum Gas (LPG) into the regulatory regime and issued an 
adequate number of licenses to carry/transport the LPG. 

 https://profit.pakistantoday.com.pk/2021/05/29/ogra-moves-to-bring-
lpg-bowsers-into-regulatory-regime/  
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Pipeline capacities for LNG terminal sponsors ordered 

 ISLAMABAD: The Oil & Gas Regulatory Authority (Ogra) on Thursday 
directed the Sui gas companies — SNGPL and SSGCL — to 
immediately allocate pipeline capacities to the sponsors of two 
upcoming terminal of liquefied natural gas (LNG) for them to proceed 
with the final investment decision (FID) and financial closure. 

 https://www.dawn.com/news/1626131  
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